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Table Lodge at Los Angeles Scottish Rite
 

GRAND ORGANIST 
TO RECEIVE HIRAM AWARD 

     Wor. Joseph Von Geczy will 
receive the Hiram Award on 
Tuesday, September 7, 2004. He is a 
Past Master of Los Angeles – Silver 
Trowel Lodge No. 42. The award 
will be presented by the Grand 
Master, Most Worshipful Howard D. 
Kirkpatrick.  The location will be 
the Santa Monica Masonic Center, 
926 Santa Monica Blvd. The evening 
will begin with at 6:30pm with a 
social hour, dinner at 7:30pm then 
the program to follow. 
     Contact Michael Marsellos at 
(310) 393-2563 for reservations. 

 
 
DOWNEY UNITED LODGE 

IS HONORING 
THE GRAND CHAPLAIN 

 
     The Grand Master will be 
attending a reception honoring 
Wor. Raymond E. Davies, the 
Grand Chaplain of the Grand Lodge 
of California. It will be hosted by 
Downey United Lodge No. 220 on 
Thursday, September 9, 2004. The 
lodge is located at 8224 3rd St. in 
Downey. Social Hour starts at 6pm 
and dinner at 7pm. The cost is $5.00.  
Contact Bob Udoff at (562) 826-2419        
for reservations. 

 
North Hollywood Lodge 

Presents the Hiram Award 
     Your humble Executive Secretary 
and Editor, Wor. Sam Pitassi will 
receive the Hiram Award from his 
lodge on Saturday, August 7, 2004. 
     North Hollywood Lodge No. 542 
is located at 5122 Tujunga Ave., just 
½ block south of Magnolia Blvd. → 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

 
LOS ANGELES SCOTTISH RITE 

EVENTS  
 

     Two major events are planned for 
the LASR in the next two months.  
     
      First, a Table Lodge will be 
held on Friday, August 13, 2004 at 
the Santa Monica Masonic Center, 
926 Santa Monica Blvd. The 
festivities will begin at 7:00pm. 
There will be a four course meal 
including prime rib and salmon. 
Souvenir Cannons (glasses) will be 
provided. 
      
     The Annual Table Lodge has 
turned out to be a much anticipated 
event and is usually well attended. 
Food, fellowship, and fun abounds!! 
This event is for Scottish Rite 
Masons only. The cost is $25.00. 
Make reservations with the 
Secretary Ron Hart at (323) 937-
2566. 
 
      Second, the LASR will be host a                                                                                       
Reception for the Grand Master 

on Friday, September 10, 2004 at the 
same location. Bring the Ladies. 
There will be a brief Stated Meeting 
at 7:00pm and the dinner and 
program will begin at 7:30pm.  
       Again, make reservations with 
the Secretary Ron Hart at (323) 937-
2566. 

 
(North Hollywood  cont.) 
       
Social Hour will begin at 6:00pm 
followed by the Presentation at 7:00. 
Dinner and entertainment will start 
immediately afterward. 
 
     The cost is $15.00. Please make 
your reservations with the Masonic 
Service Bureau Office at (818) 366-
3572. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Our Next Bureau Meeting: 

Sunday September 19, 2004 
 

Pasadena Scottish Rite 
150 N. Madison Ave  

Coffee and  Rolls  9:15 AM 
Meeting at 10: 00 AM 

 

Our Speaker Will Be: 
 

Most Worshipful 

 R. Stephen Doan 
Grand Lodge Resolutions 

 
     This is one of the most important 
meetings of the year. All of the 
Brethren planning to attend Grand 
Lodge, especially if they are voting 
delegates, will benefit from the 
explanation of the resolutions given 
by the Most Worshipful R. Stephen 
Doan. This meeting is for Master 
Masons only.       
 
     Grand Lodge is just around the 
corner. Each new year brings a new 
set of resolutions that sparks 
discussion and debate on the Grand 
Lodge floor.  No doubt that this 
year's hot topic is "the One Day 
Class." If your Master is looking for 
something to get the side-liners 
involved in during a Stated Meeting 
have him ask for opinions on the 
resolutions. 

 
Masters, Secretaries, and 

Representatives 
We need your e-mail addresses. 
Please send it to: office@lamsb.org . 
We are trying to start sending the 
Bulletin Board and other important 
news electronically. 
Notice our new Email address. 
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